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Villa Sabana liber 12-R
Price:  USD 599.999 (AWG 1.067.998)

Location:  Noord

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  3

Lot size:  361 m2

Built up size:  203 m2

Cozy Modern Living in Sabana Liber!  Introducing a remarkable 
chance to own a captivating modern house nestled in the desirable 
neighborhood of Sabana Liber. This exquisite property spans 
across a generous 361m2 of property land and offers an 
abundance of features that will make you fall in love at first sight!  
As you step into this immaculate residence, you'll be greeted by an 
atmosphere of elegance and natural light. The house boasts 3 
bedrooms and two bathrooms, each meticulously designed to 
provide comfort and tranquility. With spacious interiors and 
thoughtful layout, this home offers the perfect sanctuary for you 
and your loved ones.  One of the highlights of this modern gem is 
undoubtedly the stunning kitchen, which will awaken your inner 
chef. Equipped with top-of-the-line appliances, it effortlessly 
combines functionality with contemporary aesthetics, making it a 
true culinary haven. Whether you're hosting a dinner party or 
simply enjoying a quiet meal, this kitchen is sure to impress. The 
house's cozy ambiance is further enhanced by its exceptional 
location within a serene residential area. The surrounding 
neighborhood is known for its calmness and is highly sought after 
by those seeking a serene and safe place to call home!  Step 
outside into the meticulously landscaped garden, and you'll 
discover a slice of paradise. The fantastic poolside area beckons 
you to unwind and soak up the sun. The backyard is the perfect 
setting for relaxation and outdoor entertainment. The BBQ area 
invites you to indulge in delectable grilled delights, making this 
property an entertainer's dream. Notably, this property features a 
solar panel installation. Immerse yourself in the serenity of this 
cozy residence and experience the epitome of modern living. Don't 
miss this incredible opportunity to own a modern masterpiece in 
Sabana Liber!  Are you interested, or want to know more about this 
property? Contact Ruben Metz for a viewing! (+297) 568 6490 
ruben.metz@kw-aruba.com Follow me on socials!  Facebook: 
https://www.facebook.com/RubenMetz.KellerWilliamsAruba 
Instagram: 
https://www.instagram.com/rubenmetz_kellerwilliamsaruba/
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