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Sabanilla Abauo 7D
Price:  USD 1.460 (AWG 2.599)

Location:  Santa Cruz

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  2

Spacious 2-Bedroom, 2-Bathroom Property for Long-Term Rent in 
Sabanilla Abauo, Santa Cruz Welcome to your new home in 
Sabanilla Abauo, Aruba! This generously sized 2-bedroom, 2-
bathroom property offers a comfortable lifestyle in a secluded 
location in Santa Cruz. Property Highlights 2 bedrooms and 2 
bathrooms, providing ample space for your family. Downstairs 
features a living room, kitchen, dining area, a bedroom, and a 
bathroom. Upstairs boasts the primary bedroom, private balcony, 
walk in closet and an ensuite bathroom. Enjoy the covered front 
patio downstairs, perfect for soaking in the refreshing breeze. Air 
conditioners in both bedrooms. Washer and dryer included. 
Outdoor Delights: The backyard features a large space and fully 
tiled ideal for setting up an above-ground pool or a children's area. 
Fully fenced property for security and peace of mind. Inside parking 
and outside parking. Outside area tiled all around - Low 
maintenance.   Location Benefits: �� Santa Cruz, Aruba. Close 
proximity to local amenities and stores for your daily needs in 
Santa Cruz Rental property: Excluding utilities Furnished Pets 
allowed This property is your opportunity to embrace peace and 
convenience. Contact me now to schedule a viewing Cado de 
Lannoy +2975941420 or email cado.delannoy@kw-aruba.com
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