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Morgenster 88 - Commercial 
building with apartments
Price:  USD 365.168 (AWG 649.999)

Location:  Santa Cruz

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  5

Lot size:  1.000 m2

Built up size:  424 m2

Fantastic investment opportunity in Santa Cruz, Aruba Explore this 
property in Santa Cruz, perfect for both living and / or business. 
With an approved 60-year commercial lease land contract, this 
property is ready for either residential or commercial use. This 
property includes: Three large bedrooms, office space, and lots of 
storage — great for personal and / or business needs. Two studio 
apartments at the back, ideal for guests or rental income. Located 
on 1000m2 of long lease land right on the main road between 
Oranjestad and Santa Cruz, this spot offers high visibility and easy 
access to supermarkets, shops, and public transport. With 442m2 
of built-up space, there’s room to create whatever you need. 
Highlights:  Close to Oranjestad Residential with the option for 
commercial use (commercial long lease)  3 Bedrooms | 1 Bathroom 
Office space and lots of storage 2 studio apartments in the yard, 
perfect for rental or guests  1000m2 lease land with a renewed 60-
year lease 442m2 build-up size for flexible use Optional: Two 20 ft 
containers included with the property Property needs work  For 
more details or to arrange a viewing, please contact: Please contact 
me for more information!  Bibi Louwers +2975697343 
Bibi.louwers@kw-aruba.com
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