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Kamay Allotment Plan | Plot 9
Price:  USD 186.576 (AWG 332.105)

Location:  Noord Lot size:  507 m2

New Allotment Plan | Property Land | Located in Noord | Lot 9 
Welcome to Kamay, a prestigious new allotment plan nestled in the 
heart of Noord, Aruba's premier residential area. This exclusive 
opportunity presents a prime plot of PROPERTY LAND, offering 7 
carefully curated lots. Lot 9 offers you a total of 507 M2 / 5,457 sqft. 
Set in an idyllic location just moments from Aruba's famed beaches, 
the vibrant Palm Beach strip, and a wealth of shopping and 
nightlife, Kamay promises the epitome of island luxury living. The 
developer will oversee essential infrastructure like roads and 
utilities, ensuring a seamless transition to your new home. 
Moreover, a perpetual clause will maintain the allure of the 
community, safeguarding its elegance for generations to come. This 
initial phase showcases a limited collection of residential lots, 
destined to become the cornerstone of a beautiful new 
neighborhood. Future development will likely feature upscale 
townhomes, further enhancing Kamay's allure. New allotment plan 
in Noord Only 7 lots available 507 M2 / 5,457 sqft. Property land 
Seize this rare opportunity to secure your very own piece of 
property land in Noord, Aruba. Don't miss your chance to be part of 
this exclusive new neighborhood—schedule a viewing today, or 
inquire for more information. �� +297 742 0129 �� lars.niemeijer@kw-
aruba.com
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