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Arashi Boutique Condominiums
Price:  USD 616.000 (AWG 1.096.480)

Location:  Noord

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  2

Lot size:  78 m2

Arashi Boutique Condominiums – Exclusive Luxury Residences in 
Noord, Aruba Welcome to Arashi Boutique Condominiums, an 
exclusive collection of just twelve luxury corner units within the 
prestigious Tuscany Residence Aruba. Located in the sought-after 
Noord neighborhood, these residences offer unparalleled comfort 
and style, just minutes away from the pristine sands of Palm Beach. 
Prime Location – Noord, Aruba Arashi Boutique Condominiums are 
situated in a prime location, offering residents: Proximity to Palm 
Beach – Enjoy easy access to one of Aruba's most beautiful 
beaches. Nearby shopping and dining – Explore a variety of 
restaurants, cafes, and boutiques. Vibrant nightlife – Experience the 
lively entertainment options in the area. Whether you're seeking a 
vacation home, rental property, or permanent residence, this 
location provides the perfect blend of tranquility and convenience. 
Modern Residences with Island Charm Each condominium features: 
2 spacious bedrooms – Designed for comfort and relaxation. 2 
modern bathrooms – Equipped with high-quality fixtures and 
finishes. Fully furnished interiors – Including luxury furniture and 
smart TVs. Fully equipped German kitchen – With stove, oven, 
fridge, dishwasher, and kitchenware. Utility room – Featuring a 
washer and dryer for added convenience. Spacious terraces – 
Accessible via wide aluminum sliding doors, offering a seamless 
indoor-outdoor living experience. Air conditioning and high-speed 
internet – Ensuring comfort and connectivity. Resort-Style 
Amenities Residents enjoy access to a range of amenities designed 
to enhance their lifestyle: Luxury condominium pool – Perfect for 
relaxation and socializing. Gated community – Ensuring privacy and 
security. On-site parking – Convenient and secure for residents and 
guests. On-site maintenance team – Providing property and 
hospitality management services. Schedule a Private Tour Don’t 
miss this opportunity to own a luxurious condominium in Aruba’s 
prestigious Noord neighborhood. �� Contact us at info@kw-
aruba.com or call +297 280 9898 today to learn more about 
available units, floor plans, and investment opportunities at Arashi 
Boutique Condominiums.
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