
Keller Williams Aruba

FOR SALE

 Keller Williams Aruba

 L.G. Smith Boulevard 98, Unit 5 

 www.kw-aruba.com 

 Edwin Hekman

 +297 592 2506 

 edwin.hekman@kw-aruba.com 

Alto Vista 45-A
Price:  USD 1.495.000 (AWG 2.661.100)

Location:  Noord

Bathrooms:  4

Bedrooms:  4

Lot size:  762 m2

Built up size:  414 m2

Exquisite Luxury Residence in Alto Vista Perched gracefully in the 
scenic hills of Alto Vista, this three-story luxury villa offers an 
unparalleled blend of elegance, comfort, and breathtaking views. 
Spanning 762m² of lease land, this remarkable 4-bedroom, 4.5-
bathroom property is designed for those who seek tranquility, 
style, and convenience just minutes from Aruba’s most beautiful 
beaches. Step through the grand entrance and find yourself 
immersed in a serene, luxurious atmosphere. The villa's striking 
design blends eccentric details with modern urban touches, 
capturing the essence of the Caribbean lifestyle. Vibrant interiors 
and intricate details add to its unique charm.   The master suite 
boasts direct access to the covered terrace and pool area, offering 
a private haven for rest and relaxation. Whether you're lounging 
under the veranda, grilling on the BBQ, or savoring a glass of wine 
during Aruba’s signature sorbet-colored sunsets, this residence is 
designed to elevate every moment.   Property Highlights:  
Bedrooms & Bathrooms: 4 spacious bedrooms, each with en-suite 
bathrooms, plus a stylish powder room.   Open Floor Plan: A 
seamless flow between living, dining, and entertaining spaces, 
perfect for hosting and relaxing.   Chef-Worthy Kitchen: Featuring 
stainless-steel appliances, natural stone countertops, and a large 
island with ample storage.   Private Outdoor Oasis: A sparkling 
pool, expansive covered terrace, and lush greenery create the 
perfect setting for alfresco dining and sunset gatherings.   Eco-
Friendly Features: Outfitted with premium solar panels and a solar 
boiler to help reduce your carbon footprint. Convenient Amenities: 
A 2-car garage, adjacent storage room, and proximity to Aruba's 
top destinations.  Safety: Equipped with an extensive alarm system 
and camera surveillance. Situated just 7 minutes from Aruba’s top 
restaurants, lively entertainment spots, and pristine beaches with 
turquoise waters, this home perfectly balances seclusion with 
accessibility.   For more information please contact Edwin Hekman: 
+297 592 2506 or edwin.hekman@kw-aruba.com
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